National Electrical Code

The National Electrical Code as adopted by the
County, Maryland, with an effective date of |
effective October 1, 2002,

Board of County Commissioners of Washington
994, amended October 7, 1997, with amendments



Liber 9 Fgjig 1119

- Actg, Ordinances. Resalu
ons-Co
Clerk of the Cireuit gy
Washington Coynty

ORDINANCE TO REPEAL THE 1999 NATIONAL E ECTRICAL

AN L
CODE ADOPTED RY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF WASHINGTON COUNTY, MARYLAND ON MARCH 27, 2001

AND ENA E 2002 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY
TR DN ENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY

it

B
RECITALS Tt B 2 @i

The Board of County Commissioners of Washington Coun ty,
Maryland, being concerned with safety and fire Prevention in Washington
County, adopted the 1009 National Electrical Code on March 27, 2001,
elfective April 1, 2001,

It has been recommended ta the Board of County Commissioners of
Washington Coun ¥, Maryland, that it adopt the 2002 National Electrical
Code which is more up-to-date and which provides greater electrical
safeguards for residents of Washington County, Maryland, if implemented.

It has also been recommended to the Board, that certain
amendments be made to the text of the 2002 National Electrical Code,

A public hearing was held on September 17, 2002 following due
notice and advertisement of the text of the 2002 National Electrical Cndf:., _
with local amendments for Washington County.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED that the 1999
National Electrical Code with Local Amendments for Washington County,

adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County,



Liber 9 Folio 1120

Acts, Ovdinances. Resolutions-County
Clerk of the Circuit Court .
Washington Gnung _
Maryland, on March 27, 2001, eflective pril 1, 2001, and all other

ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed:
and

NOW, THEREFORE, BEIT ORDAINED AND ENACTED that the 2002
National Electrical Code, the contents of which are incorporated herein by
reference, is enacted with the following insertions, amendments and
additions:

[Note: new language is in ttalics

[Deletions are shown as strikeethrough)

(1)  ARTICLE 210 — Branch Circuits, is amended as follows:

Section 210.8. Ground-Fault Elmnit-InterruEter Protection for
Persnnnel, Subsection [A) Dwelling Units, is amended by adding
E:lhs_rm_,._'-ting [9) which shall read as follows:

Wl

(9]  Receptacies within 1.8m (6 ft.) of the outside edge of a laundry
sink/tub.

Exception: A single receptacle dedicated for one appliance or g duplex
receptacle with dedicated outlets for two appliances such as pumps,
water heaters, washers, and dryers.

i

Section 210.52, Dwelling Unit Receptacle Outlets, Subsection
(G} EEmeutg and Garages, is amended and shall read as
follows:

[G)] Basements and Garages. For a one-family dwelling, at least
one receptacle outlet, in addition to any provided for laundry
equipment, shall be installed in each basement and each attached
garage, and in each detached garage with electric power, The
receptacie outlets Incated in each attached and each detached garage
with electric power shall be installed at a minimum height of 450 mm
(18 in.) above the finished garage floor. See Section 210.8{A)(2) and



(2)

(3}

(4)

Liber 9 Folio 1121

| ions-County
. Ordinances, Resolutions
Ao Clark of the Clrouit Count
Washinglan County

(A)(S). Wherea portion of the basement is finished into one or more
habitable rooms, each separate unfinished portion shall have g
receptacle outlet installed in accordance with this section.

ARTICLE 250 — Grounding, is amended as follows:

Section 250.53. Grounding Electrode System Installation,
Subsection (A] Rad, Pipe, and Plate Electrodes, is amended by
adding Subsection (1) which shall read as follows:

L g

(1}  The use of twe 2.5 m x 16 mm (8 ft. x 5/8 in.) galvanized
ground rods spaced a minimum af 1.8 m (6 f1.) apart shall be reguired
Jorall new and Upgraded residential electrical services. In addition to
the two ground rods, the yse of footer grounds will be left to the
electrician’s preferences.

L F |

ARTICLE 300 — Wiring Methods, is amended as follows:

Section 300.5 Um:[ergr_unnd Installations, Subzection (D],
Protection from Damage, Subsection (3) Service Conductors, is
amended and shall read follows:
—————= 220 shall read as follows:

oy

(3) Besrvies Al Underground Conductors. Underground sesvice
conductors that are not encased in concrete and that are burjed 50

mar{18-in}or-more below grade shall have their location identified
by a warning ribbon that is placed in the trench at least 300 mm (12

in.) above the underground installation,

LA ]

ARTICLE 310 — Conductors for General Wiring, is amended as
follows:

Section 310.15, Ampacities for Conductors Rated 0-2000 Volts,
Subsection [B) Tables, Subsection (Z), Adjustment Factors, is
amended by adding Subsection (c), which shall read as follows:

ik




()

(&)

Liber 9 Folio 1122

Acts, Ordinances, Resolutions-County
Clerk of the Circuit Court
Washington County
¢}  Cables Through Framing Members. In residential application,
cables passing through framing members shall be limited to no more
than 9 cables per each 32 mm (1% in.) minimum bored hole, not to
exceed a total circuit ampacity of 180.

ke

ARTICLE 334 — Nonmetallic-She athed Cable: Types NM, NMC,
and NMS, is amended as follows:

Section 334.30, Securing and Supporting, is amended and shall
read as follows:

334.30. Securing and Supporting. Nonmetallic-sheathed cable
shall be seeured by insulated staples, cable ties, straps, hangers, or
similar fittings designed and installed 50 as not to damage the cable
at intervals not exceeding 1.4 m (4% ft.) and within 300 mm (12 in.)
of every cabinet, box, or fitting. Flat cables shall not be stapled on
edge. .

ARTICLE 680 — Swimming Pools, Fountains, and Similar
Installations, is amended as follows:;

Section 680.5, Ground-Fault CircuitI nterrupters, isamended a=
follows:

680.5 Ground-Fault Cirenit Interrupters. Ground-fault circuit
interrupters (GFCls) shall be self-contained units, circuit-breaker or
receptacle types, or other listed types. GFCI protection shall be
provided for all wiring supplying any pool pump rated 15 and 20
amperes, 125 volt and 240 volt, single phase, whether by receptacle
or direct connection,

Adopted this 1% day of October, 2002,

Effective the st day of October, 2002,



Liber 9 Folio 1123

Ordinances, Resolutions-County
s Cierk of the Cireult Courl

Washington County
ATTEST BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
F‘WﬂEHINGTGﬁ\CG NTY, R?MH’D
Joni L. E:ttm:r Clerk Gr:gnr_.'\!’_‘jE.nnbk President "

'Paul L, Swartz, Vice President /

e I N

Eemd L. Iseminger, Jr.

%SimM

Jofin L. Schneny

ﬂppmved as to form
legal sufficiency:

T

M. Mﬂrh.ranﬂ
istant County Attorney

Mail to:

County Attarney’s Office

100 W. Washington Street, Room 202
Hagerstown, MD 21740



5.

International Plumbing Code
__'_.___——____L___"

The International Plumbing Code as adopted by the Board of County Commissioners of
Washington County, Maryland, with an effect] ve date of October 7, 1997, amendments adopted
November 4, 1997, effective amendment July 1, 1998, amendments October 19, 2004 effective
November |, 2004,



00008 01055

<LERK OF THE ciacuT COURT

ACTS, ORDINANCES & WASHINGTON COUNT
RESOLLTIONS - COUNTY

INTERNATIONAL FLUMBING CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS F OR
WASHINGTON COUNTY

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland,
being concerned with securing the proper installation of systems for furnishing potable water for
sanitary sewage disposal and storm drainage and to ensure public safety, health and welfare
insofar as they are affected by regulating and controlling the desipn, Construction, quality of
materials, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to pee or
* maintenance of plumbing systems, adopted the 1993 BOCA National Plumbing Code with
amendments on Apri] 26, 1994; and _

WHEREAS, it has been recommended to the Board of County Commissioners thar they
adept the 1997 Intermnational Plumbing Code, First Edition, which is more up-to-date and which
Provides greater safeguards for residents of Washington County, Maryland, if implemented: and

WHEREAS. a public hearing was held on September 23, 1997, following due notice and
advertisement of the text of the 1997 International Plumbing Code, First Edition, with certajn
requested insertions and revisions; and

WHEREAS. public comment was received, reviewed and considered conceming the
repeal of the 1993 BOCA National Plumbing Code and the adoption of the 1997 Imternational

Plumbing Code, First Edition, including Chapters 1 through 15, Appendix B and C, and lacal

amendment.



with amendments, adopted as the Plumbing Code of Washington County,

1994, and al)

Code,

NOW, THEREFORE, be it ordained and enacted that the

=L Ry

Lo L I V]

-LERE OF THE CIZ2WAT COURT
WASHINGTGR SOUNTY

193-BOCA Plumbing Code,

Maryland on April 28,

other ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are repealed: and

NOW, THEREFOREF, be it ordained and enacted that the 1997 International Plumbing

First Edition, the contents of which are incorporated herein by reference, is enacted with

the following insertions, amendments, and additions:

L L R

The following sections, tables and appendix are hereby deleted, amended of added:

Section 101.]
Section 103
Section 103.]
Section 103.2.]
Section 103.3
Section 1063
Section 106.5.2
Section 106.5.3
Section 107.A
Section 107.1.3
Section 108.4
Section 108.5
Section 109.]
Section 109.2
Section 109.2.2
Section 109.2.5
Section 109.2.6
Section 109.5
Section 110.0
section 202
Section 305.6
Section 305.6.1

Amended
Amended
Amended
Added

Amended
Amended
Added

Amended
Added

Amended
Amended
Amended
Amended
Amended
Amended
Amended
Amended
Amended
Added

Amended
Amended
Amended

Section 404.1-404.34 Deletad

Section 404.]
Section 412 4
Table 605.4
Table 605.5
Table 608.1.4
Section 508.14
Seétion 608.16.4
Section 608.17.9
Section 608.18
Table 706.3
Section 708.3.4
Table 710.1(1)
Section 802.3.1
Section 903.1
Section 904.1
Section 917
Section 1201.2
Chapter }4- 2
Chapter ¥5
Appendix A

Amended
Amended
Amended
Amended
Added
Amended
Amended
Added
Amended
Amended
Amended
Amended
Amendad
Amended
Amended
Deleted
Amended
Amended
Added Goree— Qdd 3
Deleted



THAPTER |

section 0]
Section 1032
Section 103
Section 104
Section 10%
Section 106
Section 167
Section 108
Section 109
Section 110

CHAPTER

Section 20|
Section 202

CHAPTER 3

Seetion 300
Section 302

Section 103
Section 304
Seetian 305

section 306
Secthom 307
Rection 308

Thon M

etion 310
secteon 311
Section 3]2

CHAPTER 4

Section 40|
Section 407
Section 4003
Section 404
Section 405
Section 406
Section 407
Section 40§
Section 409
Section 410
Section 411
Seciion 412
Section 413
Section 414
Section 415
Sectson 4 16
Section 417
Section 418
Section 419
Section 420
Section 421

JUUUO Ly udid

JLERX OF THE CIRCUWT COURT

TABLE OF CONTENTS WASHIMGTOMN COUNTY
ADMINISTRATION 1 Section 422 Health Care Fixtures and Equipment
Section 423 izhy Plumbing Fixtures
General ; 1 Section 424 aucels and Ceher Fiomre Finings
Applicability I Section 425 Flushing Devices for Water Closers
Dept Of Permits & Imspections 1 and Urinals
Duties & Powers of the Code Official 2
Approval ) CHAPTERS WATER HEATERS
Permits k
Inspections and 5 Section 30]  General
Yiolations & Section 502 Installation
Means of Appeal 7 Section 503 Connections
Rules Regulations & Procedures B Section 304 Safety Devices
DEFINITIONS 9
General @ CHAPTER6 WATER SUPPLY AND
General Deffnitions b DISTRIBUTION
GENERAL REGULATIONS 17 Section 60!  General
Srction 502 Water Required
Genera| 17 Section 603 Water Service
Exclusion of Materials Detrimental Section 604 Design of Building Water
o the Sewer 17 Distribution System
Materials 17 Section 605 Maerial, Joins and Connections
Rodentproafing I8 Section 606  Inmallation of the Building Water
Frotection of Pipes and Plambeng Distribution System
System Compone (1.4 Section 807  Hot Water Supply System
Trenching, Excavation and Backfill 18 Section 608 Protection af Patable Watsr Supply
Structural Safety I8 Section 609  Health Care Plumbing
Piping Sup 19 Section 510 Disinfection of Potable Warer System
oofing 20 Section 411 Treament Units
Washroom and Toilet Room Requirements 20
Toilet Facilities for W, 20 CHAPFTER 7 SANITARY DRAINAGE
Tests and Inspections 20
Section 701 General
FIXTURES, FAUCETS section 702 Materiak
AND FIXTURE FITTINGS 13 Sectian 703 Building Sewer ;
Section 704 Drainage Piping Ins:allation
Creneral 23 Section 705 Joinu
Fixrure Materials 3 Section 706 Coanections Berween Drainage
Minimum Plumbing Facilities 23 Piping and Fixtures
Accessible Plumbing Faciliies 23 Section 707 Prohibited Joings and Conssctions
Installation of Fixtures 27 Section 708 Cleanouts
Automatic Clothes Washers 28 Section 709 Fixrure Units
Bathrubs 28 Section 710 Drainage System Sizng
Bidews 28 Section 711 Offsets in Drainage Piping in
Dishwashing Machines 23 Buildings of Five Stories or More
Drinking Fountains 28 Section 712 Sumps and Ejectors
Emergency Showers and Eyewash Stations 78 Section 713 Health Care Plumbing
Floor Draing 2 Section 714 Computerized Drainage Design
Food Waste Grinder Units 29 Section 715 Backwarer Valves
Garbage Can Washers 29
Lzundry Trays 29 CHAPTERE INDIRECT SPECIAL WASTE
Lavatories 20
Showers 29 Section 801 General
Sinks in Section 802 Indirect Wastes
Urinals 30 Section 803 Special Wastes
Water Closers 30 Section 804 Materials, Joints and Comnections
Whirlpool Batkrubs 30



CHAPTER %

on #01

«on W2
section M3
Section 04
Section W5
Section 906
Section 907
Section 208
Section 509
Secuon 910
Section 91|
Section 912
Section 913
Section 904

Section 915
Section 916
Lection 217
Section 918

CHAFTER 10

Section 10010
Section 10032
Section 1003
Section 1004

CHAFTER 11

om 1101

an 110]
thom | 103
Section | 104
Section 1105
Section 1106
Section 1107
Section 1108
Section 1109
Section 1110
Section 1111

CHAPTER 12
Section 1201
CHAPTER 13
Section 1301

Section 1302
Section 1303

JUUUY Uluod

CLERK OF THE CiRCINT
WASHINGTON COUNTY

YENTS

Crenesal

Materials

Vent Stacks and Stack Vents

Vent Terminals

Ven Connections and Grades

Fixture Vents

Individial Vet

Common Veni

Wet Venting

Waste Stack Vent

Cireuit Venting

Combination Drain and Vent Syitemn

Island Fixture Venting

Relief Vents-Stacks of More Than
10 Branch Intervals

Vents for Swck Offsers

Vent Pipe Sizi

Alr Admittance Valves - DELETED

Engineered Ve Systems

TRAFPS

General

Trap Requirements

Intereepiors and Separators
Materials, Joints and Connections

STORM DRAINAGE

General
Mazerials

Conductors and Conneetions

Fooaf Diraing

Size of Conductors, Leaders and
Eﬂnndar}' (Emergency) Roof Drains
Combined Sanitary and Sionm Symem
Values for Continuous Flow
Controlled Flow Roof Drain Systems

Sumps
FUEL PIPING
General

SPECIAL PIPING AND STORAGE
SYSTEMS

General
Medical Gayss
Oxygen Systems

68

£l

Tl
Tl
7l
T2

T2

73
73
T4
L |
e

E2
B2
E2

)

g2
E3
83

ES
&5
)

CHAPTER 14

CHAPTER 15

APPENDIX A

APPENDIX B

AFPENDIX C

Clog
APPENDIX D

APPENDIX E

Eldi
Elnz
ElD03

APPENDIX F
Fia1
APPENDIX G

Section G100
Secnon G107
Secteon G103
Section GI04
Section G105
Section G106
Section G107
Section GI10%

Section G160
Section G110
Section Gl

INDEX

COUAT

REFERENCED STANDARDS

TRAILER PARKS
PLUMBING STANDARDS

DELETED

RATES OF RAINFALL FOR
VARIOUS CITIES

GRAY WATER RECYCLING
SYSTEMS

Gray Water Recycling Systems

DEGREE DAY AND DESIGN
TEMPERATURES FOR CITIES
INTHE UNITED STATES

SIZING OF WATER PIPING
SYSTEM

General
Infarmation Required
Selection of Pipe Size

STRUCTURAL SAFETY

General Information
FUEL-GAS PIPING

General

Pipe Siring

Piping Materials

Piping Systemn Installation

Gas Shutaff Valves

Two-psi and Higher Gas Pisin

Gas Flow Cﬂltrllull'ls e

Iestallation Requirements for
Undiluted Liquefied Peroleumn
Giases {Bumne and Propane)

A Giam:-l:unneﬂinus

Gas-dispensing Systems
Supplemental and Standby Gas Supply

3
55

a7

2

101

i

v

137

138

148
140

141



JUUUY Uilgos

~LERK OF TEE Ciacur cougt
LEHJ.'S]-IJH'E TOM COUNT Y

(1) SECTION 101.1 shall read as follows:

SECTION 1011 TITLE: These regulations shal] be known as the Flumbing Code of
Washington County hereinafter referred loas

(2)

“this code”,
SECTION 103 DEPARTMENT OF PERMITS & INSPECT] ONS

SECTION 103.1 15 amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 1031 CODE OFFICIAL: The

Director of the Department of Permijts and
Inspections of Washington County shall

(3

be known as the Code Official,
SECTION 103.2.1 is added and shall read ac follows-
SECTION

103.2.1 QUAL [FICATIONS: Plumbing Combination Inspecior hired by the

County or State Eovernment after October ) . 1988 shall meet the minimum standards established
by the County and the State Plumbing Board,

A Applicani(s) for Combination Inspector(s) 111 shal] hold a Master Plumber's

license issued by the Siage of Maryland or the applicant shall be a licensed professional

mechanical engineer with at least four (4) years experience and shall

Pass a writlen examination
administered by the State Board,

business directly or indirect] ¥, during their term of employment.



(U R O | Uil vww

“LERK OF THE Ci?CUIT CouRT
L[Iﬁrj, SHINGTON SOUNTY

(4)  SECTION 103.3 is amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 1033 DEPUTIES: Combination Inspector(s) shall be hired by the County

Commissioners of Washington County, upon recommendation by the Director of Permits and

Inspections.
(3)  SECTION 1063 is amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 106.3 APPLICATION FOR PERMIT - H?M&EELIC&IIQHJ_E

MADE: Each application for a permit, with the required fee, shall be filed with the code

cfficial on a form furnished for that purpose and shall contain a general description of the
proposed work and its location. The permit application shall indicate the proposed occupancy of
all parts of the building and of tha portion of the site or lot, if any, not covered by the building
Or structure and shall cr;:uta.in such other information required by the code official. Application
for a permit shall be made by a person, or an agent, to install all or part of any plumbing system.
The applicant shall meet all qualifications established by rules promulgated with this code or by
ordinance, resolution, or statute, The full names and addresses of the owner, lessee, applicam
and of the responsible officers, if the owner or Jesses 15 & corporate body, shall be stated in the
application. The application must be signed by the Master Plumber holding a Washington
County plumbing license and doing the work. The onl ¥ exception would be when the
homeowner successfully passes a written or oral exam issued by the Washington County
Depantment of Permits and Inspections. Upon successfully passing the exam, the property owner
shall sign a release agreement stating his or her intention to do the plumbing in his or her place of
residence according to the Washington County homeowner provision and releasing the County

from any liability therefrom, Homeowner provisions do not apply to applications for public



JUUls8 Uluel

ZLERK OF THE cioouIT COURT
Lt‘ﬁ" SHINGTON COUNTY

OF private water and sewer systems and mobile homes or gas lines. Permis shall not be
processed until it is completely filled out by the licensed contractor or homeowner,
; (6) SECTION 10652 shall read as follows:
~ m}ﬁw@ SECTION 106.5.2 REGISTRATION AND PERMIT FEES SCHEDULE: The
‘ Is- U e Eistration and permit fees for all plumbing work shall be as indicated in the following schedule.
SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES AND LICENSE FEES
Prior to the issuance of any permit, the applicant shal| pay the following fees:
*(Repardless of the number of fixtures or appliances)

EESIDENTIAL

*Mobile Home 525.00
*SingleModular Dwelling 30.00
*2 Family/Semi-Detached e mebcascs rpaind
For ach ) 30.00 per unit
.Tﬂ‘“'ﬂ House d'_-ﬂ'ﬂﬂ-ﬂll'l-lllﬂl'ﬂd-ll zﬂ_m par 1T
Connection to Water 19,00 per unit
Connection to Sewer 10.00 per unit
Connection 1o Water and Sewer 15.00 per unit
“Multi-Family 25.00 per unit
Addition 1 = me hten wier ppimn) 25.00
Remodeling 1= mer Sammy sbior applices) 25.00
Hiscﬂl;nﬂ_tﬂ;rmw 15.00
[P —
Connection to Water 15.00
Connection to Sewer 15.00
EESIDENTIAL PACKAGE
Mobile Home with Water & Sewer 40.00
SingleModular Drwelling with Water & Sewer 50.00
2 Iléﬂjﬁﬁcmiﬁ‘m&hﬂ | with Water & Sewer 45.00 per unit
Connection 10 Water & Sewer 25.00



YUUUO Uiuog

=LERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT
WASHINGTON COUNTY

COMMERCIAL
C‘:{ﬂmcrﬁiﬂlnﬁ.ﬂ:a! . Hﬂﬁ%ﬁﬂani’mnﬂclin 2
wiktomd] faterr i ippluesie) S0.00
Connection 1o Water 4000
Connection to Sewer 40.00
Storm Drain 40,00
Connection to Water & Sewer 50.00
EENALTIES
Transfer of Permit 1o New Plumber 20.00

Additional inspections due 10 condemnation or
work requiring correction, work coversd up
before inspection, premare request for
inspection due fo strueture being locked
or no domestic hot water. Exemptions are
single fixture ar single appliance replacements.
This fee due prior 1o any further inspections on

property.
20.00
LICENSING FEES
mmmﬁﬂmmm
EEGISTRATION, LICENSING. AND BIENNIAL FEES
Master Plumber % 50.00 $ 100.00
Joumeyman 20,00 40.00
Apprentice 15.00 30.00
Un-Site Contractor 50,00 100.00
Appliance Installer 50.00 100.00
Drain Cleaner 50.00 100,00
*Water Conditioner N/C N/C
*Pump Installer N/C N/C
*Master Well Driller N/C N/C
*Joumeyman Well Driller N/C N/C

[T

|



Julug Uviuoag

b F THE CInsUIT COURT
HE’ELEH[H{-TIEIH COUMTY

Upon initial registration, applicant shall pay the registration and licensing fees. The
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, may, by resolution, change
periodically the registration, licensing, and biennial faes.
*The State requires these fypes of licenses to be exempt from all licensing fees,

No addiljn:_mai rencwal fee will be charged 1 applicants registering after March during the

renewal year,

-L/\)\#ﬂ (7)  SECTION 106.5.3 js amended to read as follows:

(

1

v
v
oY

mmmumwm: The code official shall authorize the refunding of

fees as follows:

. All but the application fee hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.

2 All but the application fes when no work has been done under 2 permit issued in
accordance with this cade.,

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid EXCcept upon written
application filed by the original permitiee not later than 180 days after the date of fae payment.
(8)  SECTION 107.A is added and shall read g follows:

Mmhm: The responsibility for requesting an inspection shall rest
entirely with the licensed master plumber, master well driller, on-sita wtility contractor,
appliance, pump, and water conditioner installers. who applied for the permit, or homeowner
who has successfully passed the homeowner's examination. No work shall be covered or
concealed until the work has been inspected and apprused. Improper workmanship shall be
remedied and unsatisfactory materials shall be replaced as ordered by the inspector, and the
corrections shall be reinspected, All requests for inspections shall be made 24 hours in advance
of the date requesied, All requests for final inspections shall be made within 48 hours after

b



J0008 0tosy

=LERK OF THE CIZCUIT CouRT
WASHINGTON COUNTY

completion of all plumbing by the licensed contractor. Should the contractor fail to do s0, the
homeowner may eall for the final inspection.
(%) SECTION 107.1.3 is amended and shall read as follows:

EMLULLLEIE&L_MM All work must be inspected and receive
final approval afier all plumbing fixtures and appliances connected with the water or sewer
Sysiems are set, sewers and wells are covered, and domestic hot water must be supplied at the
time of inspection. Al commercial facilities shall mark different types of piping within the
structure and tag all valves, A directory of the system in all commercial facilities shall be placed
in the mechanical room,
(10) SECTION 108.4 zhall read as follows:

mm&i_\’]ﬂLmMs: Any person who shall violate a provision of
this code or shall fajl 1o comply with any of the requirements thereof or who <hall erect, install,
alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of
the code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provision of this code, shall be
guilty of a misdemeanar. punishable by a fine of not more than $1,000.00 or by imprisonment
not exceeding one year, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues
after due notice huhcﬂns:wadshﬂtbedmdanpzmenﬂ‘m,
{(I1) SECTION 108.5 shall I'ﬁﬂ as follows:

mﬁmm%: L'pon notice from the code official, work an
any plumbing system that is being done contrary 10 the provisions of this code or in a dangerous
or unsafe manner shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to
the owner of the property, or to the owner's agent. or to the person doing the work. The notice
shall state the conditions under which work is authonzed 10 resume. Where an emergency exists,

[0



Juuls 01gss

-LERK OF THE CIRQUT COURT
WASHINGTON COUN TE’

the code official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any
Person who shall continge any work in or about the structyre after having been served with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed 1o periomm o remove a violation or
unsafe condition, shall be lisble 1 a fine of not less than $250.00 or more than $1,000.00.
(12} SECTION 109.1 is amended to read as follows:
mmmﬂbmz Any person shall have the right 1o
appeal a decision of the code official 1o the Plumbing Board. An application for appeal shall] be
based on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopied thereunder have been
incorrectly Interpreted. the provisions of this code do not fully apply, or an equally pood or berer
form of construction is proposed. The application shall be filed on a form obtained from the
code official within 20 days after the notice was served.

(13)  SECTION 1092 shall be amended 10 read as follows:

mﬂﬁiﬂ]ﬁ&sﬂm&m The Washington County Plumbing

an ex-officio, non-voling member of the Board and shall not recejve any additional compensation
for serving as a member. Two (2) of the members shall be master plumbers, thres {3) members
shall be selected from the public, and each member shall reside in the County. Two (2) members
shall be selected for three (3) year terms of office. two {2) members for two (2} year terms of
office, and one (1) member for a one (1) vear term of office. No member of the Washington
County Plumbing Board shall it on the Plumbing Board for mare than six (6) years except for
the Washingion County Health Officers or his'her designee.



JUVUO Vivoog

SLERK OF THE CIZ2UIT COURT
e s Cans Y

The Board, subject to the approval of the Board of County Commissioners of Washington
County, may make rules and regulations for the plumbing trade or business in Washington
County, as are necessary for the protection of the public health, welfare, and safery insofar as
they do not conflict with the Business Occupations and Professions Anicle of the Annotarsd
Code of Maryland,

(14)  SECTION 109.2.2 is amended to read as follows:

Sﬁmmzmwmﬁ The Board of County Commissioners of
Washington County may appoint two alternate members who chall be called by the Board
chairman to hear appeals during the absence or disqualification of a member.

(15) SECTION 109.2.5 is amended 1o read as follows:

msﬁgmx; The code official shall desi gnate a qualified clerk 1o
SETVE 25 secretary 1o the Board, The secrelary shall file a detailed record of all proceedings in the
Depantment of Permits and Inspections for Washington County, Maryland.

(16)  SECTION 109.2.6 is amended 1o read as follows:

MMMMM& Compensation of the members
of the board who may received compensation shall be in that amount as determined by the Board
of County Commissioners.

(17) SECTION 109.5 is amended to read as follows:

Smmw When five metﬁbcm are not present to hear
an appeal, either the appellant or the appellant’s representative shall have the right to request and

receive a postponement of the hearing. A new hearing shall be held within seven (7) days.



JUUUD uUiue

2 OF THE C:22UIT COURT
LE‘E'..:!LS HIHGTOM COUNTY

(18) SECTIONS 110.0 thry 110.11.1 shall read as follows:

SECTION 110.0 RULES, REG ULATIONS AND PROCEDURES

SECTION 1101 LICENSING: All licensing for the provision of plumbing services in
Washingion C ounty shall be in accordance with Titla 12, Plumbers, Business and Ceeupations
Article, Annotated Code of Maryland.

3 g ]

NSURANCE: No person shall be registered 1o perform any pIm‘Eing services nor shall any
person be issued a permit unjess that individual is registered with the Washington County
Plumbing Board and has a license issued and recognized by the State of Marvland. The
Washington County Plumbing Board shall not register a master plumber, appliance instaljer,
drain cleaner, or on-site utility contracior to perform plumbing services in Washington County,
Maryland, withous obtaining sufficient proof of insurance as set forth in Article 56, Section
462(C}($300,000 general liability and $100,000 property damage). The Cenificate of Insurance
shall remain in full force and effect and shall only be canceled or released by the Department of
Permits and Inspactions. I order 1o register with tha Washington County Plumbing Board,
master plumbers, journeymen plumbers and apprentice plumbers, appliance installers. drain
cleaners, and on-site utility contractors shall pay the established registration fee at the time
application is made and pay a bi-annual renewal fee pavable on or before the 3]st day of May of
the renewal vear. However, no additional renewal fes will be charged to applicants registering
after March during the renewal vear,

SECTION 1103 SUSPENSION REVOCATION AND FINES: The Washington

County Plumbing Board, by a two-thirds majority decision, may suspend or revoke the

13



J0008 01068

<LERK OF THE CI2CUIT COURT
W ASHINGT OH COUNT Y

shall not perform plumbing services in Washington County, M;wrand. if his'her registration 1o
dosoin Washingion County is suspended or revoked, Suspension of a registration shall be for
[0 more than one (1) vear, Revocation of a registration shall be for not less than one (] ) year nor
more than three (3) years. Any person who has heeq suspended by the Washington County
Plumbing Board two (2) times, will have his registration to perform plumbing services in
Washington County revoked upen 2 third convietion of 2 violation of the Washingtan County
Plumbing Code.

SECTION 1104 REQUIREMENTS FOR SHOW ROOM, OFFICES, SHOPS AND

VEHICLES: It shal] be required of every mastar plumber ta display, in a conspicuous place, a
sign with full repistered name or names, and the words "Registered Plumber" or "Registered
Plumbers” in letters not | ess than 1-1/2 inches in size, and immediately following or underneath,
Washington County Cenificae number or numbers in this same size. All vehicles owned by a
firm or corporation must display, in a conspicuous place, the name of the person(s) holding the
Master Certificate, the words "Registered Plumber” or "Registered Plumbers™ and the
Washington County number or numbers. Any vehicles that are not properly lettersd, the master
plumber responsible will be jesyad a violation notice and shall be given 30 days to correct the
violation. Failure to comply may result in legal action and the Department of Permits and
Inspections shall withheld the issuance of any permits o inspections for existing projects unil

the vehicles are properly lattered,

14



Juloy uviuby

=LERK OF THE CISZUIT COURT
H’AEHEHETDH CLUNTY

SE( TION 110.5 AFPPLI ANCE INST ALLERS
SECTION 1105 LICENSE: Before any person other than 2 duly licensed plumber shall

enter into the performance of the work of an "Appliance Installer”, as defined. for hire, either for
himself or as the employes of another, he or she shall obtain an Appliance Installer's license
from the Plumbing Board, Washington County Department of Permits and Inspections as

follows:

SECTION 11052 APPLIANCE INSTALIFR'S TEST: A whitien or oral test will be

given by the Plumbing Board upon request. Application for the test must be received and be
eccompanied by an established non-refundshle fee and a letter of recommendation from a
previous emplover holding a8 Washington County Appliance Installer's license. The applicant
must have five (5) years prior experience before applying for license. If the applicant fails the
fest, it may be retaken upon reapplication and payment of appropnate fees, The applicant must
post a score of 70 percent or higher 1o pass the examination. The applicant has thirty {30) days
from the test date to review the scored test,
mﬂuﬂﬂ&w

Eﬁfﬂﬂmmmmgm Any eligible person desiring 1o engage in the
business of drain cleaning shall apply for registration 1o the Washington County Department of
Permits and Inspections on a form and in a manner prescribed by the Plumbing Board. The
application shall be accompanied by an established non-refundable fee and a Certificate of

Insurance,

15



JUuuug uviuruy

SLERK OF THE CRCuiT COURT
"Eﬁgsﬁmsw:-?ctuuw

SECTION 110.7 HOMEQWNER'S PERMIT

SECTION 110.7.1 HOMEOQ WNER'S PERMIT: Washington County is permutted 1o

grant a homeowner a permit to those qualified to perform work on their swn residence, The

homeowner can do plumbing in or on his or her place of residence owned by him or her,

Plumbing work within the confines of hisher own dwelling, up to 3 fret (915 mm) from the
foundation wall on the building drain. Homeowners making application must sign a release
dgreement stating that he/she intends 1o personally oceupy the dwel ling, that said house is not for
sale, rent or commercial use, and that the house is not being built or remodeled by the property
owner for the purpose of offering it for sale, rent or commercial vse, A valid drivers license or

photo identification shall be prasented ap the time of examination,

accompanied by an established non-refundable fee, The test shall be given by the Plumbin g

Board, If the applicant fails the test, it may be rataken Upon reapplication and payment of



JUuus uviun

a FTHE CIACUIT COURT
lE\H‘J'rLEHlHETDH COUNTY

appropriate fees. The applicant must post a scare of 70 percent or higher 1o pass the
examination. The applicant has thirty (30 days from the test date to review the scored test,
SECTION 110.9 REGISTERED HOLDER; VIOLATIONS OF PLUMBING CODE

SECTION 110.9) COMPLAINTS: The Board shall recejve all complaints of any

alleged violation of the Plumbing Code filed against any individual registered by the Board,

These complaints must be in writing setting forth the nature of the alleged complaint, the time,
date and location where alleged violation was commined, and signed by the person filing the
complaint. The Board shall notify all parties to appear for a hearing on the alleged violation and
written notices shall be sent at least seven days prior as 1o the time and place of hearing. The

Board shall conduet the hearing which shall be recordad,

M 1 M

SECTION 110.10.] SCOPE;: There will be NO TRANSFER OF PL UMBING FEES OR

PLUMBING PERMITS except with the following considerations.

A releass Jenter from the homeowner and Master Plumber who originated the permit must
be presented to the Washington County Department of Permits and Inspections, stating the
reason(s) for desiring a transfer. If a ransfer of 3 plumbing permit is approved by the
Washington County Department of Permits and Inspections, an established transfer fes will be
charged the new plumber. Should the original master plumber refuse to releass his permit, the
code official will review the reasons the master plumber will not release or why a release aor
transfer is needed. The code official will the render his decision to release or ransfer. Should
cither party disagree with the code official's decision, they would have the right to appeal that

decision 1o the Washington County Plumbing Board,

17



JUUULG wiluge

ZLERK OF THE CI3CUiT COURT
LE\E-'MH[HETM COUMTY

SECTION 110.11.1 PUBLIC SYSTEMS AV ALl ARI - A public water main or publie

sewer system shall be considered available 1o a building when the building is located within 330
feet of the pisblic water main or sewer,

(1%} SECTION 202 DEFINIT] ON OF PLUMBING TERMS is amended by adding (*) 10
the following definitions:

“Appliance Installer: 4 Ppliance installer” shall mean any person who installs self-
contained appliances 1o existing water and/or sewer piping svstems, not including gas (matural,
Propane or LP), including, but nor limited 1o, humidifiers, dehumidifiers, ice-makers,
dishwashers clothes-washers and instant hot dispensers, and such work is dopa as part of a retail
sales business, as pan of a service business or part of a business mnvolving the sale of pas,
electricity or other fuel with which such appliances are operated, whether such PErs0N owns the
business or installs sajd appliances as the emploves of another,

*Drain Cleaners: “Drain cleaners™ shall mean any individual, person, or i rm who offars
1o engage in the work of clean; ng sanitary sewer drains for hire,

"Oa-Site Urility Contractor- “On-site utility contracior™ shall mean any individual,
person, or firm who performs plumbing wark while installing public water or public sewage no
closer than five (5) feet from a building being serviced.

“Service Building: Bui iding housing toilet, bathing, laundry and such other facilities as
may be required,

*Sewer Connection: That portion of the drainage piping which extends 2sa single

terminal under the trailer coach for connection with the trailer park drainage system,

18



e o

-LERK OF THE 2132t CIURT
WASHINGTCR COUNTY

*Trailer Coach: Any camp-car, trailer, or other vehicle with or without motive power,

designed and constructed 1o traval on the public thoroughfares in accordance with provisions of

the Vehicle Code and designed or used for human habitation,

*Trailer Coach-Dependent: 4 trailer coach which is not equi pped with a water closst

for sewage disposal.

“Trailer Coach-Independent: A trailer coach which is equipped with a water closet for

sewage disposal,

*Trailer Coach Drain Connection: The removable exiension connecting the trailer
coach drainage system to the trailer connection fixmure,

*Trailer Coach-Left Side: The side farthes from the curb when the tratler home is

being towed or in transit.

*Trailer Connection Fixture: A connection to a irap which is connected to the park

drainage system, and receives the water, liquid, or other wasts discharge from 2 trailer coach.

*Trailer Park Drainzge System: The entire system of drainage piping used 1o convey

sewage or other waste from a trailer connection fixture to the sewer.

*Trailer Park Branch Line: That portion of drainage piping which receives the

discharge from not more that two trailer connection fixtures.

“Trailer Park: Any area or tract of land where space is rented or held-out for rent, or

occupied by two or more trailer coaches.

*Trailer Park Sewer System: That pi ping which extends from the public or private

sewage disposal system to a point where the first traler park drainage systam branch finting is

installed,

19



JUUUDB UlU Yy

SLERK OF THE Ciac
WASHINGT 0N &

*Trailer Park Water Service M ain: That ponion of the water distnbution system
which extends from the sireet main, water meter, or other source of supply to the trailer site warer

service branch.

*Trailer Site: That area sat out by boundaries on which shai| be located one trajler,

*Water Service Connection: That portion of water supply piping which extends as a
singly terminal undsr the trailer coach for connection with the mmailer coach park water supply
svstem.

/’ (20)  SECTION 305.6 is amended and shall read 25 follows.

SECTION 305.6 WATER LINE DEPTH: Water service and wel] line piping shall be

installed below recorded frost penetration but not less than 3 fest (915 mm) below grade. In
climates with freezing temperarures, plumbing piping in exterior building walls or areas
subjected to freezing temperatures shall be protecied against freezing by insulation or heat or
both.

/ (21} SECTION 305.4.1 is amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 3056 1 SEWER DEPTH: Building sewers that conaect 1o private sewage

disposal systems shall be a minimum of 8 inches (203 mm) to 30 inches (762 mm) below the
finished grade ar the point of septic tank connection Building sewers that connect 1o public

sewers shall be a minimum of 30 inches (762 mm) below grade.

-0



10008 01075

=LERE OF THE C'2809T COURT
) AR A A

feqT ad S_
(32)  DELETE: Sections 404.1 through 404.3 4 in its entirety then amend Sections 404.1 10
T
read 25 follows: Lf-ﬂ'"-} 2l o

wmmlﬂm: Assessible plumbing fixtures shall conform 1o

COMAR 05.02.02 Maryland Acesssibility Code.

/23} SECTION 412.4 is amended and shall read as follows:

412 4 ; : : In public coin-

operated laundries and in the central washing facilities of multiple family dwellings, the rooms
containing the automatic clothee washers shall be provided with flaor drains located 1o readily
drain the entire floor area Such drains shall have a minimum outlet cross section of not Jess than

3 inches (76 mm) in diameter and shall have a trap primer device,

Amend Table 605.4 by deleting L, WL, M or WM under “Copper or copper alley

tubing.

An amended Table 605.4 is shown below:

2]



Juulse Uluie

=LERK OF THE CIRELLET COLAT
WASKIHGTOA COUNTY

Table 605.4
WATER SERVICE PIPE
MATERIAL STANDARD
Acrylonitrile butadiens snyrenc ASTM D 1527, ASTM D 2282
{ABS plastic pipe

Asbestos cement pipe ASTM C 296
Brass pipe ASTMB 43
Copper or copper Hloy pipe ASTMB42; ASTM B 302

Copper or copper alloy tubing
(Type K, WK)

ASTM B 75 ASTM B 53
ASTM B 251; ASTM B 447

Chlerinated polyvinyl chioride

ASTM D 2B45: ASTMF 41

(CPVC) plastic pipe ASTM F442; CSABI376
Galvanized steel pipe ASTM A 33
Polybutylens (PB) plastic pipe ASTM D 2661; ASTM D 2686:
and tubing ASTM D 3308; CS5A B137.8

Polyburylene (PE) plassic pipe

ASTM D 2239; CSA
CAN/CSA-BI37.)

Polyethylene (PE) plastic bing

ASTM D 2737; CSA B137.1

Cross-linked polvethvizne

ASTM 876, ASTM F 877,

{PEX) plastic mbing CSA CAN/CSA.B137.5
Cross-Haked polyeshylense! ASTM F 12B1; CSA
Aluminum/cross linked CANICSA BI37.10

pelyethylene (PEX-AL-PEX)
pips

Polyethylene/tluminum/
Polyvethylene (FE-AL-PE)
pips

ASTM F 1282, C5A
CAN/CSA B 1379

Polyvinyl chloride (PVC)
plastic pipe

ASTM D 1785: ASTMD 2241:
ASTM D 2672: CSA
CANCSA B1373

Amend Table 605.5 by deleting L, WL, M, WM under “Copper or copper alloy tubing”,

22




JUUUG Ul

= ECimoliT COURT
An amended Table 6055 i« shown musﬁﬁﬁi&ﬁ,ﬂﬂn?a céllrr.-% ru
Table P-505.5
WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPE
MATERIAL STANDARD
Brass Fip= ASTM B 43

Chlorinated polyvinyl chiorids
{(CPVC) plastic Pipe and tubing

ASTM D 2846; ASTM F 241
ASTM F 242: CSA R 137,48

Copper or copper-alloy pine

ASTM B 42; ASTM B 302

-‘Lll.'ﬂniﬂlill'lﬂtl'ﬂﬂ-ﬁnhd
Polyethylene (PEX-AL-PEX) pipe

Copper or copper-alloy twhing ASTM B 7%, ASTM B E8
(Type K, WK, L, wL) ASTM B 251; ASTM B 447
Cross-linked polyethylene ASTM F B87; CSA
(PEX) plastic rubing CAN/CSA-BI37.5
Cross-linked polvethivieng) ASTM F 12%1: Csa

CAN/CSA-BI37.10

Galvanized sieel pipe ASTM A 53
Polybusylens (PR) plassic pips ASTM D 3309, C5a
and fubing CAN3-B137.8




Uulo Uiujo

i

T COURT

LERE OF THE £in

RLEEHIETH LT EELIETEY N
sliaenud

VM 08 s3eam dev-ayepy-
Eyang IOpps -

gqrq asog wlraspue-y-
VAL papoaa e iy =
Ll PR

1=t 3aanun .

LRI TTETTCN

Wetudinba jeydon) -
Hratdinha g LILTRE
uzumdinba
Aengeasnng [rivd -
ey joad

WASHINGTON COUNT Y

L

—

Apndaase you a iy fi)

LTE]
ﬁuH_“__.p_._._“.h_...._......“. , E”.____. n..; ] foagy & padd uyesg- Medn Aupdsaiuyy _F_z_”_____ ()
1O ‘[erpiapyssy- a uotrsod Auy- | ey g oy HATSA [ aweapaiena | 2101 350y

aperll
S MAOGE [L.9) 2pi1 g jeay gy AMASEY WAL g
Lo xﬁ”uu.__ S AFQUIRGY tinnoe s )
Apan sqne asopy [ W 250y 1o s ot el | 5N HE asopy LIl assy
a5 LRI qni.z_.__naujuu L HEBNT T IMEIS LR | IR Ainggau] YIeqs il GTITET A3i]ningy
(I3 e ) ER LT L) (afemnads 0. 541) M 330A3¢] furpueg
uolpua’y sungsay S EET N T T .

R 43(] mofjuanas, Mopljaeg o mopEaay iy

VIR0 ajqu




Juule Uiy gy

LY

HAIEA J10-pugs g 3y 19 pe2ign pafieisu aq eugs FAOA LD gy JRUPRIS~ 1 ysatn iy (o
"HeREaaIE W 2 BN

= I]’Jj‘f,
(o
[
F
..M SiEueays
..,..H PUE 5000
20 amssaid ofe
i sy LT T T Ajuo pemozing-
= (pazey {100y
s Mo 1p adgy ) O 3t 1062} L gp) s0paun Ljqmassy
x stk i 08 LR1) saup gy AR A Y330y ()
) dapyinads agyy. a = Bmipging apasug- Mo dil ¥ 50 agnagg Sl0l 35Sy
A3 iy gy, -
Bpyuisds waey.
mususlinka
Iendzag -
smilky
¥ spood Sununmg
AN a0 Lpun L ULETRT PEILETRTN]
Hamm Jigjoosy. (500y) o) 2imy Fajisanh ML yaeg {q)
B3tm pagprgy- (80 s3p30) gy 00 {5 ) HHYZ 2ungsas, (e)
i (e ugy- 3 FIE g - Wipgeng opisw)- 1y 48 ¥ 0 Padipay flol assy
LB | LT TR I ] ] ATTFEY LTSI,
_"_:__us_:...uunTU"_ 0S| fone St suzmngy (afranyd s ¥Iequgal I 3MA] Piepirgg
(R HTIVETI T LTI W13 g0 aedd)
norEpLia-y SAMEEA )

BAIAR(] U0 a2, MALNIER jo LTLED TR E
¥ capmey



L R

= o W il

L

apqmdaane o am suaiyry (o)

=T
=l - - ._I - B
adAy sy
(sdmpgang | =L
add g ) susansds EIL R TENEY S
-m Sy ads ag - b Ajwo uopsod oz o 6 ¥ 5A A=y pengy PIOI ASSY
= shesds asnng-
e EITEI [Ty
r.ﬂ BEIYUIL D3]~
s ity pavngg-
W a3tanp L eadaag
m 2ERALT A mEBiA-
] Suri g e}
F Supyup oprsing- 2 uepsed fary | dI#SH | awpwena | ez assy
B yunls iwnirys _
LT T
PHEIOE 30 §EnE)
Spond Furummg. £jun jpapsa g —
SR dmg - {1aginn Jaygraig
SAOIEIOqET] - psabAng aa0qe i) sapu wnnae s (e}
waaswaniag- 3 O o (7)) s 7 - W dil ¥ 50 | sl unssan 0zl ASSY
— = - e ———— - - !'H
EL L ) [T amstalel Waedga,yg Bacjuunp)
e T B Y TS0 IR SHOFRALE ] (a3muaapdis yarqugy) 10 axa3) prepumg
R T 120787 150 UOEA3N0L] Jo add )|
UHIPIND) Amssa,
nl!u' e — - ===

E3ApAD] UOIIEIARL) O] qaRg JB e rals

¥ Iane Wy,




uooos 01081

=LERK OF THE Ci3cNT COURT
ASHIMNGTOH COUNTY

Ad} SECTION 608.14 is amended and shall read as follows:

SECTION 608,14 LOCATION OF BACKFLOW PREVENTERS: Backilow prevention
devices shall be in accordance with Table 608.1A, These devices shall be installed in accessible
locations for ease of maintenance, replacement and testing. Adequate headroom shall be
provided and a minimum of 30 inches {762 mm) of non-obstructed space shall be provided in
front of devices and a minimum of 18 inches (457 mm) shall be provided behind devices larger
than 2 inches (51 mm).

Backflow devices shall be installed inside a building in an area capable ufmainlaining a
emperanire above freezing.

f/ (23)  SECTION 608.16.4 is amended and shall read as follows:
mmuwmws
AND STANDPIPE SYSTEMS: The potable water supply to automatic fire sprinkler and

standpipe systems shall be protected against back{low by a double check-valve assembly ora

reduced pressure principle backflow preventer. All supply valves serving these devices shall be

locked in the open position and shall be acceesible,

Exceptions:

L. Where systems are installed as a portion of the water distribution system in
accordance with the requirements of this code and are not provided with a fire
department connection, isolation of the water supply system shall not be required.

2, Isclation of the water distribution systems is not required for deluge, preaction ar

dry pipe systems.

27



40008 01082 :

LERK OF THE Ciz2uiT eoyar
Iw.u.smun TCH COUNTY

/26 SECTION 608.17.9 is added and ghajj read as follows:

above finished grade.
SECTION 608.18 iz amended 1o read as follows;

SECTION 60% 18 PERIODIC

(27)

be done ae needed,
Results shay

on County Deparmen; of Permits

28



a0008 vivoy

- THE Ciz&UIT CCURT
*‘-Eﬁr’igﬂﬁmummnm”

/ (38)  SECTION 706.3 Table amended as follows.

TABLE 706.3
FITTINGS FOR CHANGE IN DIRECTION
mﬂﬁ;gm Heeizontal 1o Virtical 10 Honsonaal to

vl borizentad morizonsal
Einsrerh beng X x X
Erghan X X
Sixah bend x X X
(arier bend X i
Shirt rwesp X e
Long swesp X X X
Sandiery 12¢ g X
W X X X
Combization wyg &£ X X
2d eighth bend

For Sk | {nch= 35 4
* Festings s5all be permimed for 4 2-inch o temaller fivture Sain
% inchiey and lerper
13 limistion on diogbis SN deer, ko Secresn 13

// (29} SECTION 708.3.4 is amended and shall read as follows:

ﬁimmm: A cleanout shall be provided at the base of each waste or

soil stack. The center of the main stack cleanout shall be 3 minimum of 18 inches (457 mm)

above the finished floor.



Juuulg o, Joh

ILERK OF THE CIanuiT cOURT
WASHINGTON COUNTY

(30) Table 710.1¢1) is amended to read 25 follaws:

Table 710.1(1)
BUILDING DRAINS AND § EWERS

MAXIMUM NUMBER OF DRAINAGE FIXTURE UNITS CONNECTED TO ANY
FORTION OF THE BUILDING DRAIN OR THE BUILDING SEWER, INCLUDING
BRANCHES OF THE BUILDING DRAIN
DIAMETE Slope per foot
OF ;!PE ]
(inches) 1718 inch 18 inch 14 inch “ ech
1154 I 1
1% 3 3
2 21 21
. F 24 24
i 35 42 50
4 [BD 214 250
3 380 480 575
1 & o0 40 1.0
B 1 A0 1,600 1,220 2300
£ F P 2.500 3,500 4. 20
I2 2,900 4,600 5600 6,700
5 7000 8,300 10,000 12,000

/“a For SI: | inch = 254 mm, | inch per foot = 0.0833 mm/m
The minimum size of any building drain Serving a water closet shall be 4 inches with 2 4 inch clean out located ar the base of the
stack
b Note (b) - Not over three waler closets or three bathrosm Eroups
¢ Building sewer shall 0ot be less than 4 inches i diameter

/G1) SECTION 80231 ic amended and shall read as follows.

=ECTION 80231 SIZE OF BEECEPTOR: Waste receptor shall be sized for the maximum discharge of

all indirect waste pipes served by the receptor. Receptors shall be installed 1o prevent splashing. All waste



Jouos UI085

SLEREK OF THe CIA2UIT copaT
WASHINGTON COUNT Y

#ptor floor sinks shall be 2 minimum of 9 inches by 9 inches (229 mm by 229 mm) and installed with a
minimum of 1/4 inch raised lip above finishad floor.
/{321 SECTION 903.1 MAIN VENT REQUIRED is amended 1o read 25 follows:
SECTION 903 ] MAIN VENT REQUIRED: Every sanitary drainage system receiving the discharge of a
water ¢loset shall have a main vent that is either a vent stack or a stack vent. Such vent shall not be Jess than 3
inches (76 mm} in diameter and run undiminished in size and as directly as possible from the building drain
through to the open air above the roof.
/33] SECTION $04.1 ROOF EXTENSION is amended 10 read as follows:
SECTION 904 ]| ROOF EXTEMSION - All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall ba
terminated at least 12 inches (305 mm) above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for any purpase
other than weather protection, the vent extensions shall be run at Jeast 7 fast (2134 mm) above the roof.

Delete SECTION 917, 917.1 through 917.8 AIR ADMITTANCE VALVES

SECTION 1201.2 GENERAL is amended 1o read as follows:
cecten |LoY
SECTION 1284-2-GENFRAL - All fuel piping systems shall be sized, installed, tested and placed in

operation in mﬂmnnﬁmw- ~. fa g C&D&E ?
(35 CHAPTERSASEES = JFPs sY¢L S

g
%AGE}}E amendzd 1o read as foll
mrm—

- delda e
CGDEST‘M o LAR S ST e = pled1e b rE T TR getinn with the coher sl oo o e T i Frmipiie
Referenced
referance in code
Bumber Title section nimber

2003, 3054, 307.2, 307.3, 308.2, 300.1.1

BOCA National Building Code/1996
- 309.12, 310.1, 310.3, 403.1, Table 403.1, 404.1, 404.3, 307.2, 417.6, 606.5.2

International Mechanical Coder1996 201.3. 310.1. 422.9, 502.1, 1201.2, 1302.1

31



I LUd Ji g
- F JHE SACUIT couaT
R ARG e SOUNTY

14

"\ CHAPTER 560 TRAILER PARKS PLUMBING STANDARDS, Sections 1500 through 1509 are
added to read as follows:
1502 SCOPE: The primary objection of this chapter is to assure sanitary plumbing installations in
trailer home parks.
mmslim
SECTION 1503.] - Plumbing systems hereafier mstalled in trailer home parks shall conform to the
provisions set forth in the preceding sections of these Regulations, where applicable, and also 1o the provisions
se1 forth in this Section. Trailer home park plumbing and drainage systems, in addition, shall conform 10 all
other applicable Administrative Authority regulations,
SECTION 1503.2 PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS. Before any plumbing or sewerage dispozal
ties are installed or altered in any trauler park, duplicate plans and specifications shall be filed, and proper
permits obtained from the Administrative Authority. Plans shall show in detail-
(1) Plot plan of the park, drawn 1o scale, indicating elevations, property lines, driveways, existing or
proposed buildings, and the sizes of trailer sites:
(2)  Complete specification and piping layout of propased plumbing system or alteration: and
(3) Complete specification and lavout of proposed sewage disposal system or alteration.
SECTION 1503.3 - Trailer park plumbing system shall be designed and installed accordin E to the
requirements of the plumbing code and shall. in addition, conform to all other pertinent local ordinances and
Siate regulations.

mﬂiﬁﬂi&.&dﬁm Matenals shall conform 1o the appraved standards set forth in ather

sections of the plumbing code.



0008 01087

WASHINGTON COUNTY

SECTION 1504 SEWER:
SECTION 1504.1 -The Trailer Park Drainage System shall be designed and installed in accordance with

the requirements of the Plumbing Code, or may be installed by the use of a waste and vent drainage system,
which shall consist of an installation of waste piping, as provided in this regulation: in which the traps for one or
more trailer connection fixtures are pot separately or indspendently vented, but which are vented through the
wasle piping as such size 1o secure free circulation of air therein.

SECTION 1504.2 - Each independent trailer site shall be provided witha irapped trailer connection
which shall consist of a 3 inch (76) horizontal iron pipe-size threaded connection, installed a minimum of 3
inches (76 mm) and 2 maximum of 6 inches {162 mm) {from the bottom of the eonnection), above the finished
grade. The vertical connection to the trafler connection fixture shall be anchored in a concrete slah 4 inches
{100 mm) thick, and 18 inches by 18 inches (457 mm by 457 mm) square.

SECTION 1504.3 - Any part of the plumbing svstem extending above the ground shall be protected from
" damage when deemed necessary by the Administrative Authority.

SECTION 1304.4 - Each trailer site shall be provided with a 3 inch LP_S. male or female threaded
connection extending above the surrounding grade from a 3 inch (76 mm) mipimum size vented P-trap, Traps
shall be located with reference 1o the immediate boundary lines of the designated space or area within each
trailer site that will actually be occupied by the trailer. Each such trap shall be located in the rear third quarter
section along the left boundary line of the trailer parking area not less than | foot (305 mm) or more than 3 feet
(%15 mm) from the road side of the trailer and shall be a minimum of 5 feet (1524 mm) from the rear boundary

of the trailer site. This location may be varied by permission of the Administrative Authority when unusual

conditions are sncountered.

33



J0008 01088

- OF THE S355:7 CoURT
MR nessE EEUNTY

SECTION 1304.5 - All traps, tail pipes, verical vents, the wpper 5 feet (1324 mm) of any horizonal
vent, and the first 5 feet (1524 mm) of any trap branch shall be fabricated from materials approved for uss
within a building,

SECTION 1504.6 - A vertical pipe shall not be used in a special waste and vent system, except the vent
pipe, and the connection to the trailer connection fixture.

SECTION 1504.7 - Mobile home and travel trailer drain connections shall be of approved semi-rigid or
flexible reinforeed hose having smooth interior surfaces and not less than 3 inches (76 mm) inside dismeter,
Drain connections sha]] be equipped with 2 standard quick disconneet screw or clamp type fitting, not less in
size that the outlet. Drain connections shall be gas-tight and no longer than necessary 1o make the connection
berween the trailer coach drain connection and the trailer connection fixture on the site,

SECTION 1504.8 - Cleanouts shall be provided as required, except cleanouts shall be provided in the
' aacks 1 foot (305 mm) above grade.

SECTION 1504.9 - For the purpose of determining pipe sizes, sach trailer site connaction shall be
assigned a waste loading value of six fixmure units and each trailer park drainage system shall be sized as
provided in Table 18054, 1.

SECTION 1504.10 - Minimum grade for sewers shall be so designed that ta slope sufficient 1o provide a
mean velocity of 2 feet (610 mm) per second when the pipe is flowing full or half fiull.

SECTION 1504.11 - The discharge of the park drainage system shall be connected to a public sewer. If
a public sewer is not available within 350 fast (106.75 m) for use, an individual sewage disposal system shall be
installed, of a type that s aceeptable and approved by the Code Official.

SECTION 1504.12 - Minimum pipe size for drainage systems shall be as st forth in Table 1504.12.1,

34



JUu08 01089

=LERK OF THE CIZCUNT COURT
WASHINGTOH COUNTY

TABLE 1504.12.1

Max. No. of Trailers Max, No. of Trailess 3
Individually Vented Wer-Vented Size of
Syitems Swstems Drain
2 | 3=
KL 10 4=
100 50 ol
A00 am g
1000 e [

* The maximum length of any thres e Tap branch is six feet from its vent,
**Will require special desizn. Consult Adminiszative Authoriny,

- VENTING-
SECTION 1305.] - Each wel-venied drainage svstem shall b provided with a vent not more than 15 feet
(68.63 m) downstream from its “Pper rap. and long mains shall be provided with additional relief vents a1
vals of not more than 100 feet (30.5 m) thereafter. The minimum size of each vent servin £ 8 wet-vented

sysiem shall be as set forth in Table 15052,

TABLE 1505.2
Size of Wet-Vented Diain Minimum Size of Vot

lrl 2!

2-—

4= -

b 4

4=

[ 5"

S-

SECTION 1505.2 - The drainage system of a wiility or other building, shall not discharge into a wer-
vV dline. A house sewsr shall not discharge into a wel-vented |ins,

35



JUuuo uiluzy
-LERK OF THE SI22UIT 20uRT
Ty

WASHINGTON Coun

SECTION 15053 - A house sewer or part of 2 house sewer shall not function as a wizt-vent,

SECTION 1505.4 - All vent intersections shall be taken off above the center line of the horizontal pipe.
All vent stacks shall be supported by a4 inch by 4 inch (100 mm by 100 mm) treated post, set in at least 2 feet
(610 mm) of concrets extending at least 4 inches above the ground, or supporied by another approved method,

SECTION 1505.5 - Galvanized stee] vent pipe may extend below the ground vertically, and may directly
intersect a drainage line with an approved fitting, if the entire section around both the drain and the galvanized
pipe is encased in eoncrete 1o Frevent any movement. Galvanized steel pipe encased in concrete shall be first
coated with bituminous paint, or equivalent protective material,

SECTION 1505.6 - Vent pipes shall be located at least 10 feet (3.05 m) above grade and 10 feet from the
property line. A vent terminal from a drainage system may not be di recily beneath any door, window. or other
ventilating openings of the building or of an adjacent building, and any such vent terminal may not be within 10

horizontally of such an opening unless it is at least 3 fest {915 mm) above the top of the opening.

SECTION 1505.7 - All vent stacks in the wet-vented system shall be 3 inches or mors in diameter,
except that a 3 inch (76 mm) branch line may be vented by 2 inch (51 mm) vent.

SECTION 1505.8 - A 3 inch (76 mm) branch line shall not exceed & feet in length, and no 4 inch branch
shall exceed 15 feetin length, unless they are separately vented.

SECTION 1505.9 - Each trailer connection fixture outler shall be provided with a screw-type plug or
cap, and be effectively capped when not use,

mmmmmM

SECTION 1506.1 - Each trailer park water distibuting system shall canform 1o the requirements of this
code and shall be so designed and maintained as 1o provide a residual pressure of not less than 20 p.s.i. at each

trailer site under normal operating conditions,

36



J0008 01091

=LERK OF THE C!20INT COURT
WASHINGTON COUNTY

&

SECTION 1506.2 - Every trailer site shall be provided with an individual water service branch line
which shall be not less than 3/4 inches {19 mm) in diamaster, delivering safe, potable water.

SECTION 1506.3 - A control valve shall be installed on the water service branch, followed by a spring-
loaded check valve on the discharge side of the control valve, with 1 pressure relief valve located on the
discharge side of the spring-loaded check valve, with a hose connection or other approved anachmeng on the
trailer side of the relisf valve., Each pressure relief valve shall be equipped with a full-size drain with the end of

the pipe not more than 2 feet (510 mm) of less than 6 inches (152 mm) sbove the ground and pointing

and relief valve shall be located not less than 12 inches (305 mm) above the grade.
SECTION 1506.4 - The ssrvice connection shall not be rigid. Flexible metal tubing is permirted,
{tings at either end shall be of a quick disconnect type not requiring any special tools or knowledge 1o instal]

Of FTEmove.

SECTION 1506.5 - Each trailer outlet on the water distri bution system shall be rated ar 6 water fixmre

SECTION 1506.6 - Location of water connection.  The trailer park water outlet for each trailer coach
space shall be located near the center of the left side of cach trailer coach,
SECTION 1506.7 - Fire protection. In the design of the water distribution system in a trailer park,

consideration for fire outlet stations throughout the park should be made relative 1o the location and quantity of

water necessary during an emergency period.



YUUUO Uiy

<LERK OF THE ZincinT ECURT
EHAEHIHET':IH COUNTY

SECTION 1307 SANITARY FACILITIES:

accordance with the following ratio of traijer sites:

SECTION 1307.2 - Trailer parks constructed and operated exclusively for independent trailers shall have

one toilet; one shower; and one lavatory for each 100 sies or fractional part of them,

SECTION 1507.3. Trailer parks constructed and operated exclusively for independent traijars shall have
one oilet; one shower; and ope lavatory for each 100 sites or fractional part of them,

SECTION 1507.4 - Trailer parks constructed and operated for the combined use of dependent and
independent trailers shall have the following faciliies:

(a)  One additional toilet shal] he provided for each 100 sites or fractional part thereof in

excess of 70 gjise.

{b)  Each wiles shall be for the exclusive use of the OCEupants of the trailer sites in the trailer

parck.
TABLE 1507.4.1
' Sitey Taoiles Showersg Lavataries
2.25 1 | | -
26-70 2 ] 2
SECTION 15075 -



JUUUag uviluyds

-LERK OF THZ

Ly CJJR?
WASHNGTOY SAUNTY

__ning water for every 20 trailer sites or fractional part of them but in no caes shall there be less than two
faundry trays in any trailer park,

SECTION 1507.7 - Bathing or shower compartments. The inner face of walls of all bathing shower
companments shall be finished with Cement, concrete, metal, tile, or other approved waterproof materiale
extending 10 a height of not less than 6 feet (1.8 m) above the floor. Floore of shower compartments shall be
made of concrete or other similar impervious material. Floors shal slape to floor drains at the rate of 1/4 inch

per foot.
SECTION 1508 MAINTENANCE: Al required devices or safeguards shall be maintained in good

working order. The owner, Gperator, or lessee of the trailer park or his des; gnated agent shall be responsible for

their maintenance, When wash rooms or toilet rooms are installed, they must conform with these regulations,

SECTION 1509 RESPONSIR[I ITY-VIOL ATIONS-OPERATOR'S RESPONSIBILITY: When it is

0t that there exisis, or may exist, a violation of any peruinent regulation the owner, operator, lessee, person
in charge of the park, or any other person causing a violation shall immediately disconnect the traijer water
supply and sewer connection from the park systems and shall employ such other corrective measures as may be
ordered by the Code Official,
Adopted this_Hr— day of Oederbio , 1997,
Effective the _tn_day of Qedahieo 1997,

ATTEST: BOARD OF COUNTY C[}MHISSIDNERS
?E\Wﬂ SHINGTON C MARYLAND

Joni L. I':!n'tru:r+ C!:rk

Gregony |, \Sjmk.
|l " 3

9



Approved as to legal sufficiency:

Lz

Beth L. Evans
Assistant County Altomey

Mail to:

County Anorney's Office

100 W, Washington Streer, Room 213
Hagerstown, MD 21740

SO MO U NG ST P AT

JUUUD vivugy

LERK OF THE CIREUIT COURT
WASHINGTON COUNTY

s,

A NS
NGadd B gD

Ronald L. Bowers

/f Zﬁ CAClru, )
Les Dow %
ames ade

20

102797



00009 0017 §oZ

P bt " I-"l__l.
AOTR NI WAESSB R sutgnor 1t cncuir couay
E__':-:"_'-:::-:__ B :‘_..1:5 "‘...ULIF‘-!-".Y WASHINGTOH COURTY

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND
AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 1997 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE
WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY,
ADOPTED ON OCTOBER 7, 1997

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, being
concemned with securing the proper installation of systems for fumishing potable water, sanitary
sewage disposal, and storm drainage and to ensyre public safety, health and welfare insofar as they
are affected by regulating and controlling the design, construction, quality of materials, installation,
alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to use or maintenance of plumbing
systems, did on October 7, 1997 adopt an Ordinance entitled "AN ORDINANCE TO REPEAL THE
1993 BOCA NATIONAL PLUMBING CODE WITH AMENDMENTS ADOPTED BY THE
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF WASHINGTON COUNTY, MARYLAND AS
THE WASHINGTON COUNTY PLUMBING ORDINANCE ON APRIL 26, 1994 AND TO
ENACT THE 1997 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR
WASHINGTON COUNTY", but did not act on the proposed revised fee schedule which was
presented at the public hearing, for the purpose of allowing time for additional diseussion and public
comment on said proposed fee schedule; and

WHEREAS, public comment was received, reviewed and considersd regarding the propassd
fee schedule: and

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland,
considered the proposed fee schedule at its regularly scheduled meeting on November 4, 1997; and

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, belicves
itto be in the best interests of the citizens and residents of Washington County, Maryland, for a new
schedule to be adopted, said fee schedule to become effective July 1, 1998,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED by the Board of County
Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, that the Local Amendments to the 1997
International Plumbing Code adopted on October 7, 1997, be amended as follows:

SECTION 106.5.2 SHALL READ AS FOLLOWS:

cti s DFP : Theregistration
and permit fees for all plumbing work shall be as indicated in the following schedule.
o2

= = sl A .
A 25 199 Bjid8 e

SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES AND LICENSE FEES

Prior to the issuance of any permit, the applicant shall pay the following fees:
*{Regardless of the number of fixtures or appliances)



Uooog 001!7s

SLERK OF YHE Ci3 Uiy coust
WASHIRGTON CousTy T

RESIDENTIAL

Application Fee $20.00
*Mobile Home 25.00
*Modular Dwelling 30.00
*Single Family Dwelling 40.00
*2 Family/Semi-Detached S sryscuon s o e e 40.00 per unit
"TD'I-'-II Houze ﬂmwﬁar-urrﬁumhd-m 40,00 per umit
*Multi-Family/Apartments seams applizative coquired for exch sin 20.00 per unit
Additian i* o e Soew sde appimen) 25.00
Remodeling = = e anbir applismces) 25.00
3 lebbboesrmid Lo spsirysten)
m‘jmﬁuﬂ spplinrny) 1500
Lt firbares
Connection to public/private water 20.00
Connection to public sewer/private s&ptic 20.00
Gas Piping 20.00
COMMERCIAL
Application Fee 50.00
—Commercialindustrial - New
ncdinemsd fivtary med'm appliones] jﬂ.m
Addition/Remodel 5.00/fixture
Connection to Water 40.00
Connection to Sewer ; 40,00
Storm Drain 40,00
Gas Piping 50.00
EENALTIES
Transfer of Permit to Mew Plumber 25,00

Additional inspections due to condemnation or
work requiring comection, work coverad up
before inspection, premature request for
inspection due to structure being locked
or no domestic bot water, Exemptions are
single fixture or single appliance replacements,
This fee due prior to any further inspections on

25.00



0000S 00176

SLERR OF THE CL0ul
R A R

REGISTRATION. LICENSING, AND BIENNIAL FEES

Eesident -Resident
Master Plumber £ 50.00 $ 100.00
Journeyman 20,00 40.00
Apprentice 15.00 30,00
On-Site Contractor 50.00 100.00
Appliance Installer 50.00 10000
Drain Cleaner 50,00 100.00
*Water Conditioner N/C N/C
*Pump Installer N/C NIC
*Master Well Driller N/C N/C
*Journeyman Well Driller N/C N/C

Upon initial registration, applicant shall pay the registration and licensing fees. The Board
of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, may, by resolution, change periodically
the registration, licensing, and biennial fees,

*The State requires these types of licenses to be exempt from all licensing fees.

Ne additional renewal fee will be charged to applicants registering after March during the
renewal year,

Adopted this 4th day of November, 1997,

Effective July 1, 1998,

ATTEST: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
| Sy
"’_--E.;.h.:r \.-%‘Eb\\'\l - = =X L‘w

Joni L. Bittner, Clerk Gregory IySnool, President

ﬂr:ﬁ 5. Shank, Vice President

Ronald L. Bowers




Approved 2s to legal sufficiency:

Beth L., Evans
Assistant County Attorney

Mail to:
County Attomney's Office
100 W, Washington Street, Room 213

Hagerstown, MD 21740

NADRDMAKCEL Ll b SRS AN B

00009 00177

o]

Wiy COURT
H COUHTY




Liber 10 Folio 0372

Acls, Ordinances, Resolutions-County
Clerk of the Circuit Court
Washington County

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING
THE 1997 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE WITH

ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF WASHINGTON COUNTY, MARYLAND ON OCTOBER 7, 1997 AND
AMENDED ON NOVEMBER 4, 1997 -~ -

RECITALS

The Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, being
concerned with securing the proper installation of systems for furnishing potable water, sanitary
sewage disposal, and storm drainage and to ensure public safety, health and welfare insofar as
they are affected by regulatng and controlling the design, construction, quality of materals,
mnstallation, altesnation, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to use or maintenince
of plumbing systems, did on October 7, 1997 adopt an Ordinance enritled “AN ORDINANCE
TO REPEAL THE 1993 BOCA NATIONAL PLUMBING CODE WITH AMENDMENTS
ADOFTED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF WASHINGTON
COUNTY, MARYLAND AS THE WASHINGTON COUNTY PLUMBING ORDINANCE
ON APRIL 26, 1994 AND TO ENACT THE 1997 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE
WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY™ (the “Ordinance™).

On November 4, 1997, the Board smended the Ordinance by amending Section 106.5.2,
Registration and Permit Fees Schedule, to the Local Amendments to the Ordinance.

It has been recommended that Seetion 106.5.2, Registration and Permit Fees Schedule,
be further modified as a result of a Kaizen Event which was held to examine the work processes
and flow in the Washington County Department of Permits and Inspections.

A public heating was held on October 5, 2004 following due notice and advertisernent of
the Board's mtention to modify the fee schedule.

Any public comment was reviewed and carefully considered.

The Board believes it to be in the best interests of the citizens and residents of
Washingron County, Maryland, for the fee schedule to be further modified.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED by the Board of County
Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland that Section 106.5.2, Registeation and Permt
Fees Schedule, in the Local Amendments to the 1997 International Plumbing Code, adopted on
October 7, 1997 and amended on November 4, 1997, be further amended as follows:

M&im 1B =



Liber 10 Folio 0373

Acts, Ordinances, Resclutions-County
Clerk of the Circuit Court
Washingten County

SECTION 106.5.2 is amended and shall read as follows:

Section 106.5.2 REGISTRATION AND PERMIT FEES SCHEDULE: The
registration and permit fees for all plumbing work shall be a3 indicated in the following schedule.

SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES AND LICENSE FEES
Pricr to the issusace of any permit, the apphicant shall pay the following fees:
*[Regardless of the number of fivtures or apphances)

Note: All fees are non-refundahle,

RESIDENTIAL — FEES
—Application Fee $30.00
*Mobile Home 25.00
*Modular Drwelling 30.00
*Smgle Family Dwelling 40.00
#3 ijdjrf&mi-ﬂem:h:g] Srpunts sppleeace erpd S cuch el 40,00 per unit
*Town House Ferese sicmon s oo sk i) 40.00 per unit
“Multi-Family/ Apartments (sepanse spbortion sepsred for each it 40.00 per unit
__.Addjn'mﬂ-mmh—mnnﬁ-qa] 25.00
_Rmﬂanﬁnrmmh_:-dfwlpﬁnm] 25.00
Miscellanegiag P5se/immodding mpuin/edh 15.00
(reusrism, ¢ Ko firraren sl 've aopli
L ety 3
Cennection to public/prvate water 20,00
Connection to public sewer/private septic 20,00
(Gas Piping 20.00
COMMERCIAL
Application Fee 60.00

Commercial/ Industdal - New
(hlazirmwamm o 15 Freterm vt sprplences plen $2.00 per

weddenroi] fmvturm o i appiacr) iﬂ.ﬂﬂ
Addition/Remodel 5.00/ fixture
_Connection to Water 40.00
Connecton to Sewes 40.00
— Storm Drain 40,05

Gas Piping 50.00



Liber 10 Folio 0374

Acts, Ordinances, Resolutions-County
Clerk of the Circuit Court
Washington County

EENALTIES

Transfer of Pemmit to New Plumber 25.00
Additional inspections due to condemnation or

work requiring comection, work covered up

before inspection, premature request for

inspection due to structure being lacked

or no domestic hot water. Exemptions are

single fixture or single applisnce replicements.

Thus fee due prior to any further inspections on

propesty. 25.00

WASHINGTON COUNTY, MARYLAND
REGISTRATION, LICENSING, AND BIENNIAL FEES

Master Plumber § 50.00 § 100000
Joutneyman 20.00 40,00

entice 15.00 30.00
On-Site Contracios S0.00 100,00
Appliance Installer 50.00 100,05
Dirain Cleaner 50.00 100,00
*Warter Conditioner N/C MN/C
*Pump Installer N/C « N/C
*Master Well Daller N/C N/C
*Joumeyman Well Driller N/C N/C

*The State cequires these types of licetises to be exempt from all eensing fees

Upon initial segistration, applicant shall pay the registration and bicensing fees. The
Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland, may, by resolunon, change
peaodically the registration, licensing, and Biennial fees.

MNo additional renewal fee will be charged to applicants registering after March during the
renewal year.

Adopted this 19th day of October, 2004.

Effectve the 1st day of November, 2004,



Liber 10 Folio 0375

Acts, Ordinances, Resaluticns-County
Clerk of the Circuit Court

Washington County

ATTEST:

AR

Joni L Bittner, Clerk

Approved as to form and
legal ency:

M.

] - Martrano
Depluty County A trosmey

Mail to:

Office of the County Attorney

100 W. Washington Street, Room 202
Hagerstoun, MD 21740

mnmmmmmammgmmx‘

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

ORWASHINGTON ﬁ




